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American Pavement 

Preservation Cactus Asphalt

Intermountain 

Slurry Seal Inc. VSS International

QTY Las Vegas, NV Tolleson, AZ North Salt Lake, UT Sacramento, CA

$3.000 $3.690 $2.250 

No Bid $375,000.00 $461,250.00 $281,250.00 

S P

$3.27 $4.20 $2.35 

No Bid $408,750.00 $525,000.00 $293,750.00 

S P

$1.550 $1.640 

$387,500.00 No Bid No Bid $410,000.00 

P S

$2.21 $1.87 

$552,500.00 No Bid No Bid $467,500.00 

S P

$1.780 $1.800 

$445,000.00 No Bid No Bid $450,000.00 

P S

$2.56 $2.15 

$640,000.00 No Bid No Bid $537,500.00 

S P

Lowest Total by 

vendor

P - Primary Vendor

S - Secondary Vendor

Primary Total $832,500.00 $1,580,000.00

Secondary Total $997,500.00 $783,750.00

Asphalt Chip Seal, High 

Volume 125,000

125,000

Asphalt Chip Seal, Low 

Volume1.

2.

3. Type II Slurry Seal 250,000

6. Type III Fiber Sealant 250,000

4. Type III Slurry Seal 250,000

5. Type II Fiber Sealant 250,000


