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BID #2020-20000158

Asphalt Sealant and Services
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Ace Asphalt of 

AZ, Inc Cactus Asphalt

Hobrook 

Asphalt

Morgan 

Pavement 

Maintenance

Seal Master - 

Arizona

Sunland Asphalt 

& Construction, 

Inc.

VSS 

International

Furnish, Deliver and Apply QTY Phoenix, AZ Tolleson, AZ St. George, UT Mesa, AZ Phoenix, AZ Phoenix, AZ Sacramento, CA

$2.960 $3.350 $3.290 $2.720 

$296,000.00 $335,000.00 No Bid $329,000.00 No Bid $272,000.00 No Bid

S P

$1.24 $1.49 $1.58 $1.15 $1.07 

$372,000.00 $447,000.00 No Bid $474,000.00 No Bid $345,000.00 $321,000.00 

 S P

$0.590 $0.950 $0.550 

$177,000.00 $285,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $165,000.00 No Bid

S P

$1.96 

No Bid No Bid $196,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P

Deliver and Supply

$2.550 

No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $255,000.00 No Bid No Bid

NR

$2.35 $0.40 

No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $705,000.00 No Bid $120,000.00 

NR P

$2.250 

No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $675,000.00 No Bid $0.00 

NR

No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 

Lowest Total by vendor 

Primary $196,000.00 $437,000.00 $441,000.00
Lowest Total by vendor 

Secondary $473,000.00 $345,000.00

NR - Non Responsive

P-Primary Vendor

S-Secondary Vendor

Liquid Road 100,000

2.

Polymer Modified MasterSeal 

(PMM) 300,000

3. OptiPave 300,000

4. CQS-1H 200,000

Polymer Modified MasterSeal 

(PMM) 300,000

4.

High Density Mineral BOD 

(HA5) 100,000

1.

100,000Liquid Road1.

2.

3. OptiPave 300,000


