From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Erfert. Mike - Fire Admin Project Analyst
Subject: Walmart Facility# 1474 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57322979
Date: Tuesday, November 19, 2019 6:22:26 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 1474 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request 1D 57322979, to
receive a $1,000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58402799
Address:
One City Plaza
Yuma, AZ 85364

You will also receive a final confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/JMAIL/170059145


mailto:cgadmin@cybergrants.com
mailto:Mike.Erfert@yumaaz.gov

From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Erfert, Mike - Fire Admin Project Analyst

Subject: Walmart Facility# 4325 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57322965
Date: Friday, November 22, 2019 6:25:14 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 4325 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request ID 57322965, to
receive a $1,000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58450593
Address:
One City Plaza
Yuma, AZ 85364

You will aso receive afinal confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/170397719


mailto:cgadmin@cybergrants.com
mailto:Mike.Erfert@yumaaz.gov

From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Erfert, Mike - Fire Admin Project Analyst

Subject: Walmart Facility# 4337 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57549079
Date: Saturday, December 14, 2019 6:25:00 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 4337 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request ID 57549079, to
receive a $1,500.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58836357
Address:
One City Plaza
Yuma, AZ 85364

You will aso receive afinal confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IIMAIL/172718577


mailto:cgadmin@cybergrants.com
mailto:Mike.Erfert@yumaaz.gov

From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Erfert, Mike - Fire Admin Project Analyst

Subject: Walmart Facility# 5342 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57318167
Date: Saturday, November 16, 2019 6:19:03 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 5342 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request ID 57318167, to
receive a $1,000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58389379
Address:
One City Plaza
Yuma, AZ 85364

You will aso receive afinal confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/169796831


mailto:cgadmin@cybergrants.com
mailto:Mike.Erfert@yumaaz.gov

From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Erfert, Mike - Fire Admin Project Analyst

Subject: Walmart Facility# 7320 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57322885
Date: Sunday, November 17, 2019 6:16:28 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 7320 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request ID 57322885, to
receive a $2,000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58390351
Address:
One City Plaza
Yuma, AZ 85364

You will aso receive afinal confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/169816339


mailto:cgadmin@cybergrants.com
mailto:Mike.Erfert@yumaaz.gov

From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Erfert, Mike - Fire Admin Project Analyst

Subject: Walmart Facility# 6205 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57530755
Date: Tuesday, December 24, 2019 7:13:18 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 6205 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request ID 57530755, to
receive a $1,000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 59007539
Address:
One City Plaza
Yuma, AZ 85364

You will aso receive afinal confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/173566121


mailto:cgadmin@cybergrants.com
mailto:Mike.Erfert@yumaaz.gov
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